
Michael F. Price Chair of Supply Chain Management 
University of Oklahoma 

 
The Division of Marketing and Supply Chain Management at the University of Oklahoma 
announces a senior faculty endowed position. The opening is for a highly accomplished 
Associate Professor/Full Professor of Supply Chain Management to fill the prestigious 
Michael F. Price Chair in Supply Chain Management.  

The candidate must be strong in all three facets of an academic position associated with 
a comprehensive research university. Strong research credentials are desired, especially 
with a research emphasis in Transportation and Logistics, Procurement, Healthcare 
Supply Chain, Big Data Analysis, Planning and Strategy, Production Operations 
Management or related Business-to-Business issues.  

The candidate must already have earned reputations as nationally recognized 
scholars who continue to contribute as research scholars and leaders. The holder of the 
Price Chair must also be an accomplished teacher capable of delivering undergraduate, 
masters-level, doctoral, and executive courses. Interaction with business executives and 
managers is expected. They must have strong leadership, organization and 
communication skills, be willing to serve the college and university in important service 
roles, and be active contributors to their academic academy. 

The candidate, if hired at OU, will be expected to focus on the leading journals of Supply 
Chain, Marketing, and/or Healthcare management, such as Operations Research, 
Production and Operations Management, Management Science, Decision Sciences, 
Journal of Operations Management, Journal of Supply Chain Management, Decision 
Sciences, etc. 

The Price Chairs must be able to provide advice and leadership to the Division Director 
of Marketing and Supply Chain Management and its Advisory Board.  Moreover, the 
chair should provide mentoring to junior faculty as they become available.  

The Price College of Business is AACSB-accredited with approximately 4,000 
undergraduate, 500 master’s, and 35 doctoral students.  Its undergraduate program is 
ranked 50th by U.S. News and World Report, and its professional and full-time MBA 
programs are ranked 52nd and 58th. The University of Oklahoma is a Carnegie-R1 
comprehensive public research university and enrolls almost 32,000 students, has more 
than 2,800 full-time faculty members, and has 21 colleges.  OU became the first public 
institution ever to rank #1 nationally in the recruitment of National Merit Scholars. MBA 
classes are offered at the Gene Rainbolt Graduate School of Business, a 27,000-square 
foot facility located in the Innovation District of Oklahoma City.  The Health Sciences 
Center campuses are located in Oklahoma City and Tulsa. 

Norman is a culturally rich and vibrant town of approximately 100,000 people, located just 
outside of Oklahoma City. With outstanding schools, amenities, and a low cost of living, 
Norman is a perennial contender on the “Best Places to Live” rankings.  Visit 
soonerway.ou.edu for more information. 



Please use http://apply.interfolio.com/54144 to submit required application materials 
(CV, Cover Letter, Research Statement, Teaching Philosophy). Protected veterans, 
individuals with disabilities, women, and minorities are encouraged to apply.  Nominations 
of strong candidates are also appreciated. 

If you have questions concerning this opportunity, please contact: Jack J. Kasulis, Ph.D. 
at jkasulis@ou.edu 

For more information, please refer to these web sites: 
http://www.ou.edu/price 
https://www.ou.edu/dam/provost/documents/facultyflipbook.pdf 
http://www.ou.edu/publicaffairs/oufacts.html 

The University of Oklahoma, in compliance with all applicable federal and state laws and 
regulations does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, sexual 
orientation, genetic information, gender identity, gender expression, age, religion, 
disability, political beliefs, or status as a veteran in any of its policies, practices, or 
procedures. This includes, but is not limited to:  admissions, employment, financial aid, 
housing, services in educational programs or activities, or health care services that the 
University operates or provides. 
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